CoUNCIL COMMUNICATION

AGENDA TITLE: Adopt resolution rejecting the low bids from Hendrix Wire and Cable Co. and Pirelli Power
Cables for fallure to meet specifications, and award the bid for the purchase of 78,500 fi.,
total, of 750 komil, #4/0 and #1/0 AWG, 15 kV, EPR insulated underground cables {o the low
bidder, The Okonite Company, of S3an Ramon, CA, in the amount of $137,241.19 (EUN.

MEETING DATE: June 18, 2003
SUBMITTED BY: Electric Utitity Director
RECOMMENDED ACTION: That the City Council adopt the altached resolution rejecting the low bids

from Hendrix Wire and Cable Co. and Pirelli Power Cables for failure to meet

specifications, and award the bid for the purchase of 78,500 ft_, toial, of 750
komil, #40 and #1/0 AWG, 15 kV, EPR insulated underground cabies to the low bidder, The Okonite Company, of
San Ramon, CA, in the amount of $137,241.19

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: At the meeting of May 7, 2003, the City Council approved specifications and
authorized advertisement for bids for various sizes and lengths of 15 kV
underground cable. The specifications requested bids on two different types

of cable insulation, namely crosslinked polyethyvlene (TR-XLPE) and elhylene propylene rubber {EPR ) with different

sizes willin sach type. The bidders were informad that the Cily was in the process of evaluating the two types of
caile and that only a portion of the cables being bid would actually be purchased,

Following the bid opening on May 28, 2003, all the bids received were evaluated and simifar cable sizes within each
nsulation type were compared. This cost comparison over the cables' life coupled with a number of other advantages
gained by using EPR insutation vields the recommendation to award the bid for the aclual cable requiremsnts o the
low bidder meeting the specifications, The Okonite Company of San Ramon. The low monetary bidders, Hendrix Wire
and Cable Co. in all categories and Pirelii Power Cables in the #4/0 AWG category, did not meet the specifications
and thergfore, i is recommended to reject these bids,

Some of the advantages with EPR cable over TR-XLPE are: longer expected service life; cable is more flexible
resuiting In easier installation with associated labor savings; cable has higher ampacily (load carrying capability); is
resistant o "raeing”, a phenomenan causing cable failure in TR-XLPE cables. EPR insulated cable has been adopted
85 the standard by several area utilities, including PG&E, Merced and Turlock Irrigation Districts,

The low menetary bidders have been contacled and the discrepancies from the specifications discussed. These
midders understand the reasons for the recommendation to award to the next lowest bidder.

FURDING: Avgaitable within the Department's Financial Plan and Bu

anbhe, MGl
\!i{:ky McAthie, Finance {}zrector

Alan N. Vallow, Electric U
PREPARED BY: Hans Hansen, Manager, Engineering and COperalions
Attachment (hid evaluation)

> City Attorney
Purchasing Officer

: APPROVED: @«/ /‘{Z )// e fl ,

< K Dixdn Flyan - City ¥




Bid Evaluation

Medium Yoltage Cable with EPR insulation

May 2003

32,500 I of 780 kol

Bidder

Price incl. tax. ($)

Comments

Delivery {(weeks)

The Dkonite Company

Piralli Power Cables

Page Blect. Co. CME Wire & Cable
The Ketlte Company

Western States, Kerite

Hendrix Wire and Cable Co.

LJIN Electric Co,, Lid.

Nexans Energy USA, Inc.

72,082.43
76,319.33
84,004 .59
93,066,91
55,447 .64
71,864.53
No bid
No bid
No bid

Bid TR-XLPE type cable

1-3
12-14
12
6-8
79
8

Southwire Company

10,000 1. of 4410 AWG

Bidder

Price incl. tax. (§)

Comments

Delivery (weaks)

The Ckonite Company

Fage Elect. Co. GME Wire & Cable
The Kerite Company

Westers Staies, Kerite

Hendrix Wire and Cable Co.

Piralll Power Cables

ILJIN Eléctric Co,, Lid.

Nexans Energy USA, Inc.
Soythwire Company

13,888 98
14,223.00
16,326.28
16,744.35
12,800.7¢
13,6808 83
No bid
No bid
No bid

Bid TR-XLPE type cable
Did not meet specifications

1-3
12
6-8
7.8
8
12-14

Bidder

Price incl. tax, (§)

Comments

Delivery {(weeks)

The Ckenite Company

Pirelli Power Cables

Page Flect. Co. SME Wire & Cable
The Keriie Company

Wastern Blates, Kerite

Hendrix Wire and Cable Co.

iLJIN Elactrie o, Lid,

Nexans Energy USA, Inc.
Southwire Company

§4,292.78
52,291.08
53,877.16
67,086.23
68,796.22
51,200.65
Mo hid
No bid
MNo bid

Bid TR-XLPE type cable

1-3
12-14
12
6-8
7-8
8

Cable avaluation EFR May03 Xs



RESOLUTION NO. 2003-103

A RESOLUTION OF THE LODI CITY COUNCIL
REJECTING THE LOW BIDS AND AWARDING THE
BID FOR THE PURCHASE OF VARIOUS SIZES OF

15 KV EPR INSULATED UNDERGROUND CABLE

WHEREAS, in answer {0 notice duly published in accordance with law and the order
of this Gity Council, sealed bids were received and publicly opened on May 28, 2003, at
11:00 am. for 78,500 faet of 780 komil, #4/0 and #1/0 AWG, 15 kV, EPR insulated
underground cables, described in the specifications therefore approved by the City Coungcil
on May 7, 2003; and

WHEREAS, said bids have been compared, checked, and tabulated and a report
thersof filed with the City Manager as shown on the attached marked Exhibit *A"; and

WHEREAS, the specifications requested bids on two different types of cable
insulation, nameiy crosslinked polvethylene {TR-XLPE) and ethylene propylene rubber
(EPR) with different sizes within each type. The bidders were informed that the City was
in the process of evalualing the two types of cable and that only a portion of the cables
baing bid would actually be purchased; and

WHEREAS, following the bid opening on May 28, 2003, all the bids received
were evaluated and similar cable sizes within each insulation type were compared. This
cest comparison over the cables’ life coupled with 2 number of other advantages gained
by using EPH insulation yields the recommendation to award the bid for the actual cable
requirements to the low bidder meeting the specifications, The Qkonite Company, of
San Ramon. The low monetary bidders, Hendrix Wire and Cable Co. in all categories
and Pireili Power Cables in the #4/0 AWG calegory, did not meet the specifications, and
therefore, it is recommended to reject these bids; and

WHEREAS, some of the advantages with EPR cable over TR-XLFE are: longer
expected service life; cable is more flexible resulting in easier installation with
assoclated labor savings; cable has higher ampacity (load carrying capability); and is
resistant to "treeing®, a phenomenon causing cable failure in TR-XLPE cables. EPR
insulated cable has been adopied as the standard by several area utilities, including
PE&E, Merced, and Turlock irrigation Districts; and

WHEREAS, the City Manager recommends rejecting the low bids from MHendrix Wire
and Cable Co. and Firelll Powsr Cables for failure 1o meet specifications, and further
racommends awarding the bid for the purchase of 78,500 feet total of 750 komil, #4/0 and
#1/0 AWG, 15 kV, EPR insulated underground cables to the next responsible bidder, The
Okonite Company, of San Ramon, Callfornia, in the amount of $137,241.19.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Lodi City Councit dogs hereby
raject the low bids from Hendrix Wire and Cable Co. and Puelli Power Cables for failure to
meet specifications, and further awards the bid for the purchase of 78,500 feet total of 750
komil, #4/0 and #1/0 AWG, 185 kY, EPR insulated underground cables 1o the next
responsible bidder, The Ckonite Company, of San Ramon, Califormnia, in the amount of
$137.241.1¢8,

Dated: June 18, 2003




[ hereby certify that Resolution No. 2003-103 was passed and adopted by the City
Council of the City of Lodi in a regular meeting held June 18, 2003, by the following vole:

AYES: COUNCIL MEMBERS ~ Beckman, Hansen, Howard, Land, and
Mavor Hitcheock
NOES: COUNCIL MEMBERS ~ None

ABSENT: COUNCH. MEMBERS ~ None

ABSTAIN: COUNCHL MEMBERS ~ None

SLUSAN J. BLACKSTON
City Clerk

2003-103
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Bid BEvaluation EXH :

Medium Voltage Cabie with EPR Insulation - May 2003
Higder _ Price ingl. tax. (%) Commenis Dialivary (waaks)
The Gkonile Company TZ062.43 i3
Fireil Powet Cables 76.319.33 12-14
Page Elsct. Co. CME Wire & Cable 84,004.59 12
The Kerife Company 93,086 91 68
Western Stales, Kerite 46,447 B4 TG
Hendrlx Wirg and Cable Co. 71,664 83 Bid TR-XLPE type cable ]
ILJIN Elactrit Go,, Lid, MG bid
Nexans Energy USA, Ing, No bid
Southiwira Company No bid

Bidder Price inl. tax. ($31 Comments Deiivery (weeks) |

The Olkonite Company 13,088.88 13
Page Blect. Co. CME Wire & Caple 14,223.00 12
The Ketite Company 16,326.28 8-8 -
VWastern States, Kerile 16,744.35 7-8
Hendrix Wi and Cabie Co. 1280070 Bid TR-XLFE type cabie 8
Piralli Powsr Cables 13,608.83 Did not meet specifications 12-14
LI Blactric Co,, Lid. No bid

Mexans Ensogy USA, Inc. Mo bid

Suuthwirg %ax@am N bid

Biddar Price incl. tax. {$} Comments Delivery (weoks)
The Gkenite Company §5%,299.78 1-3
Pirglli Power Gables 52,241.08 12-14
Page Elsct Co. CME Wire & Cable 5387718 12
Thie Kerite CGompany 87,086.23 B -
Western Slales, Ketite 68,798.22 a8
Haindrix Wirerand Gable Co. £1,200.86 Bid TR-XLPE type cabile 8
HHN Electric Co,, Lid, No big
Naxane Energy USA, Ing. No big
Southwire Company N big

Cable ovaluaiion EPR Maylaxs




