AGENDA ITEM E"-,

CITY OF LODI
CounciL COMMUNICATION

AGENDATITLE: Adopt Resolution Awarding the Purchase of Polemount Transformers to GEXPRO
(GE Supply) of North Highlands, CA ($27,567.88) (EUD)

MEETING DATE: September 5, 2007
PREPAREDB Y Electric Utility Director

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Adopt a resoluton awarding the purchase of polemount
transformersto GEXPRO (GE Supply), of North Highlands, CA.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: On May 16, 2007, the City Council authorized the Electric Utility
Department (EUD) to advertise for bids as necessary to meet the
EUD's needsfor polemounttransformers through the fiscal year.

On July 18, 2007, bids were opened for nine sizes of padmount transformers, and life-cycle COStS were
evaluated (life-cycle costs are the combined total purchase price plus 00St of operation based on
estimated power loss during the projected life of the transformer). Proposals were also evaluated on the
basis of compliance with equipment and bid specifications. There were nineteen (19) different polemount
transformers with ratings at 25kVA, 37.5kVA and 50kVA & different terminal voltages. Five
manufacturers submitted bid proposals and GEXPRO (GE Supply) of North Highlands, California showed
the lowest life-cycle costs for all advertised transformers. A summary of the bid evaluation is attached as
Exhibit A. Some of the transformers are planned for use in a commercial development on Reynolds
Ranch and other residentialand commercial developments and upgrades within the C I .The remaining

transformers are to bring the number of stock transformers of different sizes to the required inventory
level.

FISCAL IMPACT:  Priceis $27,567.86
FUNDING: Account No, 160650.

L
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Cuse 11

George F. Morrow, Electri¢ Utility Director

Preparedby: Demy Bucaneg, Jr., PE. Manager, Engineering& Operations
GFM/DB/ist
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APPROVED: ~ =— )
BlaifKirg, iy Manager




Transformer Bid Evaluation

Bid Opening: July 18, 2007

EXHIBIT A

Polemount Tax (factar):| 1.0775 Primary Winding: 12 000 “aolt Line-to-Line
Mo Load Loss $hwatt: 375
July 18, 2007 Load Loss $hwatt:  1.25
Bid ftem 1: 25kVA, 120/240 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Mumber of units: 5 457 500
Mo Load | Load
“endor LInit Extended Frice Loss Loss | Mo Load Load Cost of | Life Cycle | Delivery | Height | Weight
Price 5 = Price § weltax b teeatts) | (watts) Loss walue Loss walue Losses § | Costd pweeks) | (inches)  (pounds)
ERMCo c/o Hees Enterprises, Inc. 117500 587500  6,330.31 53 345 110625 215825 326250  9,592.81 12-14 409”7 397
WESCO Distribution 1211000 605500  6,524.26 63 36 118125 2162500 334375 9,868.01 10-12 397 376
GE Supply - Gexpro 893500 492500  5,306.69 a3 465 9937E 284375 IRITE0 9144197 10 B4 346
Howard Industries, Inc. 151300 758500  8,151.29 GE e 127500 196875 324375 11,3954 8-10 32[ 327
Central Maoloney, Inc. Mo Bid
Bid Item 2: 37.5kVA, 277 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Mumber of units: 2 157 625
Mo Load | Load
“endaor LInit Extended Frice Loss Loss | Mo Load Load Cost of | Life Cycle | Delivery | Height YWWeight
Price 5 | Price § witax § fwatts) | [watts) Loss walue Loss value | Losses § Cost 5 fweeks) | (inches) | (pounds)
ERMCo cfo Hees Enterprizes, Inc. 15045000 3096.00 333594 a2 77 B90.00 94280 1632500 4,968.44 12-14 4087 813
WWESCO Distribution 1,345.00) Z2p9000  2,898.48 a3 460 697500 1150000 184750  4,745.98 10-12 407 42126
GE Supply - Gexpro 114500 225000  2.467.48 77 B35 57750 149000 206750 4,534.987 10 394" 464
Howard Industries, Inc. 253400 5183.00 559007 a0 49 B7500 104750 172280 731257 8-10 6" 457
Central Maloney, Inc. Mo Bid



jperrin
EXHIBIT A


Bid ftem 3: 37.5kVA, 120/240 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Mumber of units: 5 180 525
Mo Load | Load
“endar Lnit Extended Frice Loss Loss | Mo Load Load Cost of | Life Cycle | Delivery | Height YWWaight
Price 5 | Price § witax § fwatts) | (watts) Loss value Loss value  Losses § Cost 5 (weeks) | (inches) | (pounds)
ERMCo cfo Hees Enterprizes, Inc. 147300 786500 847454 g 402 1575000 2512500 408750 12,562.04 12-14 4087 816
WESCO Distribution 136700 583500  7,364.71 ga 586 185000 3BR250 531250 12677.21 1-2 46" 47777
GE Supply - Gexpro 132500 BE2500 7,138.4 g3 403 155625 251875 407500 11.213.44°7 10 ME" 445
Howard Industries, Inc. 2,113.00 10,565.00  11,383.79 95 M4 178125 ZAS7A0 438875 15,752.54 8-10 377 433
Central Maloney, Inc. Mo Bid
Bid ftem 4: 37 5kVA, 240/480 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Mumber of units: 1 187 525
Mo Load | Load
“endor LInit Extended Frice Loss Loss | Mo Load Load Cost of | Life Cycle | Delivery | Height Weight
Price % | Price § wiltax § oeatts) | (watts) Loss value Loss value  Losses b | Cost fweeks) | (inches) | (pounds)
ERMCo c/o Hees Enterprizes, Inc. 1565000 158500  1,686.29 g6 392 32280 49000 812500 2,498.79 12-14 4097 514
WESCO Distribution 1459400 149400  1,609.79 g1 g65 30375 70E.25 1010000 2,619.79 10-12 427 521585
GE Supply - Gexpro 154500 154500  1,664.74 76 334 28500 M7E0 70280 2,367.24° 10 377 462
Howard Industries, Inc. 257600 257600 2,775.64 94 433 35280 54875 90125 3,676.89 8-10 36" 442

Central Maoloney, Inc.

Mo Bid




Bid ftem 5: 50kVA, 120/240 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Mumber of units: 5 51 800
Mo Load  Load
“endor Unit Extended Frice Loss Loss | Mo Load Load Cost of | Life Cycle | Delivery | Height = Weight
Price # | Price § witax § fwattsy | (watts) Loss walue Loss value | Losses § 0 Cost § fweeks) | (inches) | (pounds)
ERMCo c/o Hees Enterprizes, Inc. 176300 881500  9,498.16 103 497 15931256 3108.25 5037.50 14,535.66 12-14 4097 573
WESCO Distribution 176100, 880500  9,487.39 106 B05 19587500 3781.25 576875 15,256.14 10-12 467 53494
GE Supply - Gexprao 169500 549000  9,147.98 a2 498 172600 3112580 483750 13,985.48" 10 3417 607
Howard Industries, Inc. 302200 15110000 16,281.03 116 465 275000 292500 510000 21,381.03 g-10 w7’ 542
Central Maloney, Inc. Mo Bid
Bid ftem 6: 50kVA, 240/480 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Mumber of units: 1 =17 a00
Mo Load | Load
“endor Unit Extended Frice Loss Loss | Mo Load Load Cost of | Life Cycle | Delivery | Height | YWeight
FPrice 5 | Price % weitax B fwatts) | (watts) Loss value Loss value Losses § Cost 5 fweeks) | (inches) | (pounds)
ERMCo cfo Hees Enterprizes, Inc. 1729000 172500  1,863.00 105 4900 39375 12450 100625  2,869.25 12-14 4087 Ll
WESCO Distribution 1875000 187500  2,020.31 16 445 43500 85625 99125 3.,011.56 10-12 37" 57308
GE Supply - Gexpra 171000 171000 184253 95 425 3E7.AD £3500 90250  2,745.03"7 10 342" 569
Howard Industries, Inc. 320100 3201.000 3,449.08 M7 434 43575 842560 98125 4,430.33 8-10 36" 532
Central Moloney, Inc. Mo Bid

GE Supply - Gexpro| $27567.86



RESOLUTION NO. 2007-174

A RESOLUTION OF THE LODI CITY COUNCIL
AWARDING THE BIDS FOR THE PURCHASE OF
POLEMOUNT TRANSFORMERS

WHEREAS, in answer to notice duly published in accordance with law and the order of
this City Council, sealed bids were received and publicly opened on July 18, 2007, at
11:00 a.m., for the purchase of polemount transformers for the Electric Utility Department,
described in the specificationstherefore approved by the City Council on May 16, 2007; and

WHEREAS, said bids have been compared, checked, and tabulated and a report
thereof filed with the City Manager as shown on Exhibit A attached; and

WHEREAS, the City Manager recommends the award of the bids for the various types
and ratings of polemount transformers for the Electric Utility Department be made to the
bidder(s) whose proposal and equipment meet City of Lodi specifications and whose
transformers are expected to yield the lowest overall life-cycle costs, listed as follows:

5 each 25kVA 120/240 Volt, 1-Ph GEXPRO (GE Supply) $ 5,306.69
2 each 37.5kVA 277 Volt, 1-Ph GEXPRO (GE Supply) $2,467.48
5 each 37.5kVA, 120/240 Volt, I-Ph  GEXPRO (GE Supply) $7,138.44
1 each 37.5kVA, 240/480 Volt, 1-Ph  GEXPRO (GE Supply) $ 1,664.74
5 each 50kVA, 120/240 Volt, I-Ph  GEXPRO (GE Supply) $9,147.98
1 each 50kVA, 240/480 Volt, 1-Ph GEXPRO (GE Supply) 1.842.53
$27,567.86

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the award of the bids for the purchase of
polemount transformers for the Electric Utility Department be and the same is hereby awarded
to the lowest responsible bidders, as shown above, in the total amount of $27,567.86.

Dated: September 5, 2007

| hereby certify that Resolution No. 2007-174 was passed and adopted by the City
Council of the City of Lodiin a regular meeting held September 5, 2007, by the following vote:

AYES: COUNCIL MEMBERS - Hansen, Hitchcock, Katzakian, Mounce, and
Mayor Johnson
NOES: COUNCIL MEMBERS - None

ABSENT: COUNCIL MEMBERS - None

ABSTAIN: COUNCIL MEMBERS 5 @8l

RANDI JOHL
City Clerk

2007-174




Transformer Bid Evaluation

Bid Opening: July 18.2007

EXHIBIT A

Polemount Tax (factor) 1 0775 PrimaryWinding: 12.000Volt Line-to-Line
NO Load Loss §iwatt 375
July 18, 2007 Load Loss $/watt 1 25
Bid tem 1. 25kVA, 1201240Volt, Single Phase. Conventional. Pole Number of units 5 5 500
Mo Load  Load
Vendor Unit  Extended  Pnce Loss Loss No Load Load Cost of Life Cycle Oelivery Height  Weight
Price§ Pnce$ witax § (watts) (watts) Lossvalue Lossvalue Losses$  Cost$ (weeks) (inches) (pounds)
ERMCo c/a Hees Enterpnses, Inc 1,170 5,87500 6,330.31 59 345 110825 2,15625 3.25250 9,592.81 12-14 40" 397
WESCO Gistribution 1,21100 6,05%0  6,524.26 63 M6 1,181%5 2,16250 3,34375 9,868.01 , 10-12 3 3176
GE Supply - Gexpro 98500 4,92500 5,306.69 53 455 99375 2,84375 3.83750 9,144.1% 10 %4" 346
Howard Industries, Inc 1,51300 7 565.00 8,151.29 68 315 127500 1.96875 3,24375 11,395.04 8-10 32 327
Central Moloney. Inc No Bid
Bid ftem 2; 37.5kVA, 277 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Number of unts 2 Z:) 625
No Load Load
Vendor Unit  Extended  Pnce Loss Loss No Load Load Cost of Life Cycle Delivery  Height  Weight
Price§  Price 5 witax § (watts) (watts) Lossvalue Lossvalue Losses$  Cost (weeks) (inches) (pounds)
ERMCo =/o Hees Enterpnses. Inc 1,54800 309600 333594 92 377 6%0.00 04250 153250  4,968.44 12-14 409" 513
WESCO Distribution 1,34%0 2,600 2,898.48 93 460 69750 1,15000 1.84750 4,745.98’ 10-12 g 2%
GE Supply - Gexaro 1.14500 229000 2.467.48 7 596 57750 1,49000 2067.50 4.534.98 10 ey 464
Howard Industries. Inc 2,59400 5.18300 5,590.07 90 419 67500 1,04750 1,7225%0  7,312.57 8-10 w" 457

Central Moloney. Inc No Bid




Bid lterr 3: 37 5%VA, 120240 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Number of units 5 48' 625
Mo Load  Load
Vendor Unit  Extended  Price Loss Loss No Load Load Cost of Life Cycle Delivery  Height  Weight
Price§  Price $ witax § {wafts) (watts) Lossvalue Lossvalue Losses5  Cost§ (weeks)  (inches) (pounds)
ERMCo c/o Hees Enterprises. Inc 1567300 786500 847454 84 402 1,57500 2,51250 4,08750 12,562.04 12-14 409 516
WESCO Distnbution 136700 683500 7,364.71 88 586 1,65000 3,66250 5,31250 12,677.21 1-2 46 47777
GE Supply - Gexpro 132600 6,62500 7,138.44 83 403 155625 2,51875 407600 11,213.44' 10 46" 446
Howard Industries. Inc 211300 1056500 11,383.79 95 414 178125 258750 436875 15.752.54 8-10 37 433
Central Moloney. Inc No Bid
Bid itern 4: 37 5kVA, 240/480 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Number of units 1 48 625
No Load Load
Vendor Unit  Extended  Pnce Loss Loss  No Load Load Cost of  Life Cycle Delivery Height  Weight
Pnce§ Pnceb5  wftax$ (waits) (watts) Loss value Lossvalue Losses &  Cost5 (weeks) (inches) (pounds)
ERMCo /0 Hees Enterprises. Inc 156500 156500 1,686.2% 86 392 32250 490.00 81250  2,490.79 12-14 409' 514
WESCO Distribution 149400 149400 1.609.7¢ 81 565 30375 70625 1,01000 2,619.79 1012 42 521%
GE Supply - Gexpro 154500 154500 1.664.74 76 334 28500 41750 70250  2,367.24"7 10 AT 462
Heward Industnes, Inc 2576 00 257600 2,775.64 94 439 35250 54875 90125  3,676.89 8-10 6 442

Central Moloney, Inc No Bid




Bid ftem 5 50kVA, 120240 Volt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Number of units 5 T 800
No Load Load
Vendor Unit  Extended  Price Loss Loss  No Load Load Cost of Life Cycle Delivery  Height  Weight
Price§  Price 5 whax 5 fwais)  (watts) Lossvalue Lossvalue Lossesb — Cost$ (weeks) (inches) (pounds)
ERMCo ¢/o Hees Enterprises, Inc 1763.00 881500 9,498.16 103 497 193126 3,10625 5037.50 14,535.66 12-14 4007 573
WESCO Distribution 176100 880500 9.,487.39 106 605 198750 378125 576875 13.256.14 10-12 %) , 53494
GF Supply - Gexrrro 169800 B.490.00 9.,147.98 92 498 172500 311250 4837.50 13.985.48" 10 Al 607
Howard industries, fnc 302200 15,11000 16,281.08 16 468 2,17500 292500 5,10000 21.381.03 8-10 37" 542
Central Moloney. Inc No Bid
Bid tein 6: S0KVA, 240/480 VVolt, Single Phase, Conventional, Pole Number of units 1 ' 800
No Load Load
Vendor Unit  Extended  Price Loss  Loss NoLoad Load Costof Life Cycle Delivery Height  Weight
Price$  Price$ witax § (wafts) (watts) Lossvalue Lossvalue Losses$  Cost% (weeks) (inches) (pounds)
ERMCo ¢/o Hees Enlerpnses, Inc 1,72900 172900  1,863.00 106 4890 39375 61250 100625  2,869.25 12-14 409" 558
WESCO Distribution 1,87500 1,87500 2,020.31 116 45 4300 55625 P15 301156 10412 F 57808
GE Supply - Gexpm 1,710 1,71000 1,842.53 938 428 3w7T S0 53500 90250 2.745.03" 10 KV 569
Howard Industries. Inc 3,20100 320100 3,449.08 117 434 43875 54250 9Bl D5  4,430.33 8-10 K3) 532

Central Moloney, Inc

No Bid

GE Supply - Gexpro $27567.86






