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Continued April 1, 1981 

Item No. 2 - Dense Grade Asphalt Concrete, 
Type B 1/2". Asphalt Binder 
shall be Viscosity Grade AR-4000 
Paving Asphalt. 

A 
F~O.B. Plant 

(50 Tons) 

Cost per ton including tax 

Plus: City cost for mileage 

TOTAL 

B 
Stockpile 

City Limits 
(SO Tons) 

Cost per ton including tax 

Plus: City cost for mileage 

$21.7 3 

7.53 

$29.26 

$25.28 

TOTAL $25.28 

c 
Hopper of Paver 

(SO Tons) 

Cost per ton including tax 

Plus: City cost for mileage 

TOTAL 

$25.97 

$25.97 

on motion of Councilman Murphy, McCarty second, 
Council adopted Resolution No. 81-30 awarding 
the contract for Asphalt materials for the fourth 
quarter of F.Y. !980-81 as follows: 

Claude C. Wood Co. 

Industrial Asphalt 

Item No. lA & B 
Item No. 2A 

Item No. lC 
Item No. 2B & C 
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RESOLUTION NO. 81-30 

AWARD - CONTRACT FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS - FOURTH 
QUARTER FISCAL YEAR 1980-81 

WHEREAS, in answer to notice duly published in accordance 
with law and the order of this City Council, sealed bids were 
received and publicly opened by the City Clerk of this City on 
April 1, 1981 at 11:00 a.m. for the Contract for Asphalt Materials­
Fourth Quarter Fiscal Year 1980-81 as described in the specifi­
cations therefor approved by the City Council March 18, 1981; and 

Wi-lEREAS, said bids have been compared, checked, and tabu-· 
lated.and a report thereof filed with the City Manager as shown 
on Exhibit "A", attached hereto and thereby made a part hereof. 

WHEREAS, the City Manager recommends that award be made to 
the low bidder, 

BIDDER ITEM NO. AMOUNT 

Claude C. Wood co. lA $27.005 
lB $25.97 
2A $26.74 

Industrial Asphalt lC $27.03 
2B $25.28 
2C $25.97 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the 
City of Lodi that award of Contract for Asphalt Materials-Fourth 
Quarter Fiscal Year lYB0-81 be and the same is hereby made to 

BIDDER 

Claude C. Wood co. 

Industr~al Asphalt 

ITEM 

lA 
lB 
2A 

lC 
2B 
2C 

81-30 
-·1-

NO. AMOUNT 

$27.005 
$25.97 
$26.74 

$27.03 
$25.28 
$25.97 



Dated: April 1, 1981 

I hereby certify that Resolution No. 81-30 was passed 
and adopted by the City Council of the City of Lodi in 
a regular meeting held April 1, 1981 by the followlng 
vote: 

Ayes: Councilmen- McCarty, Murphy, Hughes, Pinkerton 
and Katnich 

Noes: Councilmen -None 

Absent: Councilmen -None 

tku_ !;, /1-k;xc-l;___ 
ALICE M. REIMCHE 
City Clerk 

81-30 
-2-
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BIDS FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS 

ITEM NO. I ITEM NO. 2 

i\ 
! 1 

Dense Grade Asphalt Concrete, Type 8 Dense Grade· Asphalt Concrete, Type 8 
3/8". Asphalt Binder shall be Vi sec~ i ty 1i2". Asphalt Binder shall be VIscosity 
Grade AR-4000 Paving Asphalt. GradL AR-4000 P•vlng Asphalt. 

I' 

I, SUPPLIERS A B c A B c 
F.O.S. Plant Stockpile Hopper of Paver F.O.S. Plant Stockpile Hopper of ?aver 

City Lim! ts City Limits 
(300 Tons) (100 Tons) (500 Tons) (50 Tons) (50 Tons) (50 Ton~) 

• 1 a uc e ~ . wooc t..o . , C 1 emen ts 
Cost per ton Including tax $ 23.055 $ 25.97 $ 27.56 $ 22.79 $ 25.705 $ 27.295 

Plus: City cost for mileage 3.95 3.95 

TOTAL $ 27.005 $ 25.97 s 27.56 $ 26.74 $ 2.5.705 $ 27.295 

Granite C"nstruction Co., 
Stockton 

I Cost per ton including tax $ 23.06 $ 26.50 $ 22.53 $ 26.24 

i Pl:d: City cost for mileage 5. 19 NO BID 5.19 NO BID 

! 

I 
1 
j 

1 
i 

' TOTAL $ 28.25 $ 26.50 $ 27.72 $ 26.24 I 
i 

! 
I ' 

l ndustr I a l Ast:halt 1 Linden 

Cost per' ton ! nc 1 ud I ng tax $ 22.79 $ 26.29 $ 27.03 $ :21.73 \s 25.28 $ 25.97 

Plus: City cost for mileage 7.23 7.53 

TOTA'l. $ 30.32 $ 26.29 $ 27.03 $ 29.26 $ 2.5.28 $ 25.97 
' 



® CITY OF LODI COUNCIL COMMUNICATION 

Materials - Fourth Quarter Fiscal Year 1980-81 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: That the city Counc i I award the bid for Asphalt Materials 
for the fourth quarter of the Fiscal Year 1980-81 as follows: 

Claude c. Wood Company9 Clements I tern No. A & B 
Item No. 2 A 

Industrial Asphalt, Linden I tern No. c 
I tern No. 2 B & c 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: The specifications for asphalt materials were approved 
by the City Council on Hare~ 18, 1981. Bids were opened on Wednesday, April I, 
1981 and three bids were received. The cost of asphalt materials increased 
approximately nine percent since the last bid was requested in October 1980. 

A tabulaljion f the bids 

\ I ' 
/-~·c} 

/ Ja;:\ L. Ronsko 
' Pub.Jc Works Director 

received is attached for your information. 

At.w'chment 

cc: Bob Holm 

GCB:slb 

APPROVED: FILE NO. 

'----------~·_R;.;;E~N.;,;R,;.Y;..,.;.A_:.. GLAVES, City Manager 



I CITY OF LODI 
PUBLIC ~ORKS DEPARTMENT BIDS FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS 

ITEM NO. I ITEM NO. 2 

Dense Grade Aspha It Concrete, Type 8 Dense Grade Asphalt Concrete, Type B 
3/8". Aspnalt Binder sha I I be Viscosity 1/2". Aspha It Binder sha I I be Viscos_ity 
Grade AR-4000 Paving Asphalt. Grade AR-4000 Paving Asphalt. 

SUPPLIERS A B c A 8 
I 

c 
F. 0. B. Plant Stockpile Hopper of Paver F. 0. B. Plant Stockpile Hopper of Paver 

.. ---. c i t y Lim i t 5 City Limits! 
"">j 

(300 Tons) (IOOTons) (500 Tons) (50 Tons) (50 Tons) i (50 Tons) 

-
Elauae e. llooa Eo., ~lements 

I Cost per ton including tax s 23.055 $ 25.97 $ 27.56 s 22.79 s 25.705 $27.295 

Plus: c i t y cost for mileage 3.95 I 3.95 I ----
TOTAL $ 27.005 s 25.97 s 27.56 $ 26.74 s 25.705 s 27.295 

Granite Construction Co., I 
Stockton 

Cost per ton including tax s 23.06 s 26.50 s 22.53 s 26.24 
--... , 

' rlus: City cost for mileage 5. 19 NO BID 5. 19 I NO BID 

TOTAL s 28.25 s 26.50 $ 27.72 $ 26.24 I 

Industrial Asphalt, Linden 

Cost per ton including tax $ 22.79 s 2 6. 29 s 27.03 s 21. 7 3 s 25.28 $ 25.97 

Plus: City cost for mileage 7.53 7.53 

' $ 26.29 
I 

29.26 s 25.28 TOTAL $ 30.32 s 27.03 $ $ 25.97 

' I 


