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AWARD - BID FOR 
PAIMXNI' 
TRANSFORMERS 

RES. NO. 86-54 

OC-12(d) 
CX:-20 
a::-47 

CITY ~IL ME.ETING 
APRIL L6, 1986 

City Manager Pr'!terson presented the foll<:Ming bids which 
had been received for various pa.dnount transfonrers: 

Westinghouse Electric $76,657.08 

Central Maloney $30,134.00 

General Electric SUWlY Co. $i6,437.66 

Square D Ccrrpany $53,576.64 

Maydwell & Hartzell $79,589.04 

R1'E Corporation $79,993.96 

Following reccmnendation of the City Manager, Council 
adop~ Resolution No. 86-54 awarc:li.ng the bid for 
pa.drrount transfomers as follows: 

Maycn..ell arXl Hartzell, Inc. 

5 - 37.5 Kv.A, single phase, $5,156.90 
1~- 50 KVA, single phase, $13,457.76 
5- 100 Kv.A, single phase, $8,517.10 

Westinghouse Electric Supply Co. 

1- 112.5 KVA, three phase, $3,510.72 
1 - 300 RVA, three phase, $5,448.40 
2 - 1000 Kv.A, three phase, $25,069.00 
1 0 1500 RVA, three phase, $14,617.40 
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__ t:'9UNCIJ. C9_~fl\1U_NJCAJ'J~ 
---------------,----------

.TO: THE CITY COUNCIL DATE NO. 
April 3; 1986 ·-_ _ FROM: THE CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE .. ,. .. . .• __ . . 

. 
SUBJECT: PURCHASE OF PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS EUD-86-2 

On Tuesday, April 1, 1986, bids were received for five 37.5 KVA, twelve 50 KVA 
and five 100 KVA single-phase and one 112.5 KVA, one 300 KVA, two 1000 KVA and 
one 1500 KVA three-phase padmount transformers. 

The transformers will be used to serve the following developments and to 
replenish the inventory of back up units: 

Woodlake North #2 and #3 
Meadows #2 
Tandy Ranch #2 
Large Industrial facility 
Lodi Metal Tech 
Church of L.D.S. 
La Petite Academy 
Lakeshore Towers 

Based on design data supplied by the bidders, the life-cycle cost of transformer 
losses has been evaluated. Column "B" is the dollar value associated with these 
losses. Based,on minbmwm total life-cycle cost of the transforoer, lt is 
recommended that the bid be awarded to the lowest bidoer in each category, as 
follow&: 

Maydwell & Hartzell, Inc. 

5 - 37.5 KVA, single phase 

12 - 50 KV~, " " 
5 100 KVA, " " 

Westinghouse Electric SuEEli Co. 

_1 - 112.5 KVA, three phase 

1 - 300 KVA, " " 

2 - 1000 KVA, It It 

1 - 1500 KVA, " " 

$ 5,156.90 

13,457.76 

8,517.10 
$27,131.76 

$ 3,510.72 

5,448.40 

25,069.00 

14,617.40 
$48,645.52 

The total cost of the award is $75,777.28. The engineer's estimate for this 
purchase was $88,000. 

Sufficient funds are available in the Electric Department's operating fund for 
this purchase. 

Attach. 
c.c. Assist. Elec. Utility Director 

Electrical Engineer 

-' •.f -~•---,.. .. •~ ...... -~ .. -·-~~--.-.r ._.."'·--
•' '·:» 

HenryJ:"Re 
Electric Utility Director 
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RESOLUTION NO. 86-54 

AWARD - BID FOR PAD-MOUNT TRANSFORMERS 

WHEREAS, in answer to notice duly published in 
accordance with law and the order of this City Council, 
sealed bids were received and publicly opened by the City 
Clerk of this City on April 1, 1986 at 11:00 a.m. for the 
contract for Stockton Street Improvements, Vine Street to 
Tokay; described in the specifications there:. .,r approved by 
the City Council March 5, 1986; and 

WHEREAS, said bids have been compared, checked, 
and tabulated and a report thereof filed with the City 
Manager as shown on Exhibit "A" attached hereto and thereby 
made a part hereof. 

WHEREAS, the City Manager recommends that award 
be made to: 

Maydwell and Hartzell, Inc. 

5 37.5 KVA, Single phase 
12 - 50 KVA, Single phase 

5 100 KVA, Single phase 

Westinghouse Electric Supply Co. 

1 - 112.5 KVA, Three phase 
1 - 300 KVA, Three phase 
2 - 1000 KVA, Three phase 
1 1500 KVA, Three phase 

$ 5,156.90 
13,457.76 

8,517.10 

$27,131.76 

$ 3,510.72 
5,448.40 

25,069.00 
14,617.40 

$48,645.52 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City 
Council of the City of Lodi that award of contract for Pad­
Mount Transformers be and the same is hereby made as set 
forth above. 

Dated: April 16, 1986 



I hereby certify that Resolution No. 86-54 
was passed and adopted by the City Council 
of the Ci~y of Lodi in a regular meeting 
held April 16, 1986 by the following vote: 

Ayes: 

Noes: 

Absent: 

Council Members - Olson, Pinkerton, 
Hinchman, Snider, and 
Reid (Mayor} 

Council Members - None 

Council Members - None 

fitav~~ 
Alice M. Reimche 
City Clerk 

86-54 

-- - -- - .:.-·- -·-
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EUD-~.:2 

DATE: 14·11·86 

···., ' 1:~ 

. tftUUtlftftftftftftt~j:~tt 
t City of Lodi ~ .. t 
• . Utility Deputatnt · .. • t 
• Trinsforatr lid EYihtition t 

,fflftff.flttffftffttffttttfttf 

DATEa 14·11-86 
TYPE: Pidaount, singlt·phist, 241/121·volt ·'tYPE& Pidtoult 1 Silglt-phist1 241/121·volt 

SJZEa 51. tV• SIZE: 37,5 kvi . 
OTY: 5 t· am 12 

SUPPLIER 

'A' 
TOTAL PRICE 

FOB LODJ 
INCL TAl 

($) 

•a• 
COST OF 
LOSSES 

($)'' 

'A + 8' 
LIFE·CYCLE 

COST DELIVERY 
1U . IIIEEKSl 

::::::::::::::::::::::: :::::::::a ::aa:a:aaa aaaaaaa:aaa :::a::aa: 

"AYDIIELL l HARTZELL 
Brisbine, CA 

5,156.91 2,922.!5 8,179.65 7·11 

-·--------------------- ---------- ---------- ----------· ··-·-···· 
CENTRAL ftOLONEY 

Pine Bluff, AK 

RTE CORP. 
Portlind, OR 

GENERAL ELECTRIC CO. 
Eaeryville, CA 

IIESTINGHOUSE CORP. 
· Concord, CA 

4,961.81 3,145.51 8,116.31 16~18 

5,231.11 2,965.11 8,196.11 18·21 

5,199.31 3,119.75 8,319.15 13•15 

5,411.71 3,161.75 8,562.45 ' 11·13 

SQUARE·D CO. no bid 
Hay•ird, CA 

----------------------- ---------- .......... ----------- ---------

'A' 
TOTAL PRICE '8' 'A + 8' 

FOB LODI (\,ST OF LIFE·CYCLE 
INCL TAX LOSSES COST DELIVERY 

SUPPLIER lfl lSI lSI IWEEKSl 
aaaaaaaacsaaaaaaaa::::a a:a:::a::s aaaaaaaa:: aaa:::aa::: ........ . 

IIAYDIIELL .• HARTZELL 
Brhbint, CA 

13,457.76 8,315,21. 21,762.96 7·11 

----------------------- ---------- ---------- ----------- ........ . 
RTE ~ORP. 12,783.61 9,146.81 21,831.41 18·21 

Portlind 1 OR 

GENERAL ELECTRIC CO. 13,864,81 8,542.21 22,417.11 13·15 
Enryville, CA 

-------··---·------·-·· ---------- ----·----- ----------- _" ______ _ 
WESTIIISHOUSE CORP. 

Concord, CA 

CENTRAL IIOLONEY 
Pine Bluff, AK 

. 14,538.96 8,278,81 22,817.76 11·13 

16,418.81 8,328.11 24,736.81 16·18 

SQUARE-D co. no bid 
H•ynrd, CA 
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EUD-86·2 

DATE: 14-11-BII 

. IUIHttlttfH. ftlttftt~ It . . .. \1~~ 
t .. City of Lodi . t .· 
t Utility Depuhent t . 
• Tr~nsforHr Bid Evilu•Uon • · 
•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

DAT£1 14·11·86 
TYPE: Pidaount, single-phase, 241/121-volt 
SIZE: Ill kn 

TYPEs P•daount, three•phise, 218¥/121-volt 
SlZEz 112.5 KVA 

QTY: 5 

SUPPLIER 

'A' 
TOTAL PRICE 

FOB LODI 
INCL TAl 

lSI 

•a• 
COST OF 
LOSSES 

m 

'A + 8' 
. LJFE·CYCLE 

COST DELtVERY 
lSI IIIEEKSI 

======================= ========== :::::::&:: :::::::::: ::::::::: 
"AYDNELL ~ HARTZELL 

Brisbane, CA 

~ESTINSHOUSE CORP. 
Concord 1 CA 

CENTRAL "OLONEY 
Pine Bluff, AK 

8,517.11 5,982.11 14,499.11 7·11 

8,171.91 6,711.58 14,783.41 11·13 

8,71111,21 61151,11 14 1917,21 16-18 

------·---------------- --------- -·-------- ---------- ---------6ENERAL ELECTRIC CO. 8,5114,81 11,421.51 14 1985.31 13·1S 
Euryville, CA 

RTE CORP. 8,787.41 7,161.75 15,849.15 18-28 
Par tl and 1 OR 

----------------------- ---------- ---------- ----------- --------· 
SQUARE-D CO. no bid 

Hayward, CA 

QTYI J 

SUPPLIER 

·'A' 
TOT;'IL PRICE 

FOB lODI 
INCL TAX 

lSI 

'8' 
COST OF 
LOSSES 

($) 

'A + a· 
LIFE-CYCLE 

COST DELIVEW 
lSI IIIEEKSI 

::s:::::aa:::aa:::::a:: =•:::::::: s::s::;::: ::::a::=~== &:::::a:c 

WESTINGHOUSE CORP, 
Concord, CA 

KAYDWELL • HARTZELL 
Brhbine, CA 

RTE CORP. 
Porthnd, DR 

3,511.72 1,771.95 5,282.117 23·25 

4,877.B2 1,612.118 ~,691.42 13-16 

4,234.71 1,787.21 11,121.98 12-14 

-----------·---------~- ---------- ---------- ----------- ---------GENERAL ELECTRIC CO. ·4,473.21 1,731.15 6,214.2~ 13·15 
Eaeryville, CA 

SQUARE-D CO, 5,1119.411 1,891.91 7,499,26 Ill 

CENTRAL ntllOIIEY no bid 
Pine Bluff 1 AK 

,/·) .. 
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EUD-8o;.;'2 

DATE: 14-11·86 

·. $~ 
·. ltttHttttttttttittttl~j;yu •• 
• · .. City of .Lodi ' t 
•' ·Utility Deputaent 1 . 
1 Trinsforaer Bid Ev&la&tion 1 
llllllllffflfftfffffHitlltiH 

DATE1 14 .. 1•86 
TYPE: Pidaount, three·phist 1 481Y/277·voit 
SIZE: 311 KYA 

,,:.5 

TYPEs Pidaount, three-phist, 481Y/277·volt 
SIZEs 11H KVA 

QTY: I 

SUPPLIER 

"A" 
TOTAL PRICE 

FOB LODJ 
INCL TAX 

($) 

•a• .·'A+ a•. 
COST OF . LIFE·CYCLE ESTIKATED . 
LOSSES .COST DELIVERY 

($1 It) IKEEKSI 
======================= ====================· ::::::::::: ===*====== 
MESTINGHOUSE CORP, 

Concord, CA 

KAYDWELL l HARTZELL 
Br i ~bint 1 CA 

GENERAL ELECTRIC CO. 
Eaeryville, CA 

RTE CORP, 
Porthnd, OR 

5,44B.41 3,196.15 8,644.55 23~25. 

6,127.86 3,138.25 9,266.11 13-16 

6,275.21 3,154.51 9,429.71 13-15 

5,717.64 3,719.85 9,437~49. 12-14 

-·-----------------·--- --------------------- ----------· ----------
SQUARE-D CO. 7,179.74 3,643.21 11,722,94 16 

· Hayurd 1 CA 

CEMTRAL ftOLOMEY no bid 
Pine Bluff, AK 

DTYs 2 

SUPPLIER 

"A" 
TOTAL PRICE 

FOB LODI 
INCL TAl 

1$) 

'B' 
COST OF 
LOGSES 

($1 

'A + 8' 
LIFE-CYCLE ESTIKATED 

COST DELIVERY 
l$1 IIIEEKSI 

::z:::::a::aa::aa::aa:: :::a:::a::::::a:::z:: aa::::::a:: a::::::::: 

KESTIM&IIOUSE CORP, 
Concord, CA 

25,109.11 1B,I46.41 43,115.41 23·25 

GENERAL ELECTRIC CO. · 241394.84 18,738.21 43,133.14 13-lS 
Eaeryville, CA 

··--····--------------- -------------------·· ----------- --...--~--
KAYDKELL $ HARTZELL 

Brisbi1111 CA 
26,186.24 17,111.41 43,297.64 13-16 

.---------------------- --------------------- ~--------- ----------SQUARE-D CO. 
H•y•ud, CA 

2S,Bt4.76 181617.71 43,682.46 16 

----------------------- --------------------- --------·-- .. --------RTE CORP, 26,834.96 19,183.41 46,118.3~ 12-14 
• Portlilld1 OR -------..----------- ------------- ------ -----

CENTRAl ~OMEY 110 bid 
Pine Bluff, AK 
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it . (r:J'\ tttftUUUt~'~.~.;i~!li~ttttt~Ut . . . ~·. . ' . it~').· : \ ;:) ··:.· ·.· ,',· ·.: .. ' . . -~ 1.;;2:!1 
; , EUD-8b:..2 t ,, City :,of;L~i .,: ... · .. t .···. . ·.~ . 

'>i. • UtillJY .. Depaftaeilt? • .· 
t Tnnsfoner.8id Evilu1Uon t .............................. ' 

¥ 

DATE: 14-11-86 
TYPE: Padaount, three-phise 14BIY/277-volt 
SIZE: 1508 KVA 

QTY: 1 

'A' 
TJTAL PRICE . '.8~ 
fOB LODJ .COST OF 
lHCL TAL LOSSES 

SUPPLIER ($) ... ($) 

'A + 8' 
LIFE-CYCLE lsUaated 

COST .. , OELtVERY 
.· lSI ·.•. )·.·::(WEEkSI 

::::::::::::::::::::::: ::::::::::::::::::::: :::::::::::,:::::::::: 
~ESTlNGHOUSE CORP. 14,617.41 14,135.15 28,652.55 23-25 

Concord, CA 
./· 

----------------------- --------------------- ----------- ----------
GENERAL ELECTRIC CO. 

Eaeryville, CA 

SQUARE-D CO, 
Hay11ard 1 CA 

"AYDNELL ' HARTZELL 
Brisbane, CA 

15,137.86 13,917.95 29,155,81 13-15 

15,823.68 13,252.11 29,175.68 16 

16,165.36 13,278.65 29,344.11 13•16 

-~--------------------- ----------.----~--- ----------- ----------RTE CORP. 16,484,56 13,914.61 31,319.16 12-14 
Port! and 1 OR 
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