RES. NO. 85-57
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City Manager Peterson presented the following bids which
had been received for "Salas park Playground Improvewents, .
Phase V, Landscaping Materials":

Bidder Bid

nelta Tree Farms, Inc. $ 6,157.81
OKI Nursery $ 6,375.90
Escalon Landscaping $ 6,652.65
Ken Owen Landscaping S 7,224.27
Pietro Talini's Nursery $ 7,800.63
B & V Landscaping, Inc. $ 8,219.35
Albert Stein Landscape Co. $ 9,508.05
Weigum's Nursery $14,238.19

COUNCIL ADOPTED RESOLUTION NO. 85-57 AWARDING THE CONTRACT
FOR "SALAS PARK PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS, PHASE V,

1ANDSCAPTNG MATERIALSY TO ESCALON LANDSCAPING OF ESCALON IN
THE 2AMOUNT OF $6,652.65
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CITY OF LODI COUNCIL COMMUNICAT.ION“

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
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City Council Project Data

Approved in F.Y. Budget: 1984/85
Fund: Capital Outlay Reserve
Amount Budgeted: (Total) $107,000
Total Project Estimate: 5 9,700
Bid Opening Date: L/24/85

FROM: City Manager
BDATE : May 7, 1985

SUBJECT: Salas Park Playground lmprovements
Phase V, Landscaping Materials

PUS——

RECOMMENDED ACTiON: That the City Council award the contract for the above project
to Escalon Landscaping of Escalon in the amount of $6,652.65.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: This project consists of supplying landscaping materials
for the three acres fronting Salas Park. The Recreation § Parks Department has
arranged to have local volunteer organizations plant the trees and shrubs. Plans
and specifications for this project were approved on Aprit 3, 1985. The City has
received the following eight »ids for this project:

BIDDER LOCATION BiD

3 Delta Tree Farms inc. Stockton $ 6,157.81%

: Oki Nursery Sacramento $ 6,375.90%*
Escalon Landscaping Escalon $ 6,652.65
Ken Owen Landscaping Lodi $ 7,743.67
Pietro Talini's Nursery Sacramento $ 7,800.63
B & V Landscaping Inc. Elk Grove $ 8,219.35
Albert Stein Landscape Co. Stockton $ 9,508.05
Weigum's Lodi Nursery Lodi $14,238.19
En9|neer s imate $ 6,355.00

ack L. Ronsko
ubilic Works Director

cc™ Assistant Finance Director
Recreation & Parks Director

JLR/ ML/ eeh
*The two lowest bidders did not bid all the items requested in the plans and

specifications. Comparative analysis of the bids indicated Escalor Landscaping
as the actual low biader.
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kN THORAS A. PETERSOM, City Manager
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CITY OF LODI COUNCIL COMMUNICATION

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

y,
)

City Council ‘ Project Data
. Approved in F.Y. Budget: 1984/85
FROM: City Manager Fund: Capital Qutlay Reserve
. : Amount Budgeted: (Total)} $i07,000 )
DATE: April 25, 1985 Total Project Estimate: $ 9,700
Bid Opening Date: 4/24/85

SUBJECT: Salas Park Playground Improvements
Phase V, Landscaping Materials

RECOMMENDED ACTION: That the City Council award the contract for the above
project to Delta Tree Farme, Inc. of Sacramento in the amount of $6,157.81.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: This project consists of supplying landscaping materials
for the three acres fronting Salas Park. The Recreation & Parks Department has
arranged to have local volunteer organizations plant the trees and shrubs. Plans
and specifications for this project were approved on April 3, 1985. The City has
received the following seven bids for this project:

BIDDER OCATION BID
Delta Tree Farms inc. Stockton $ 6,157.81
Oki Nursery Sacramento $6,375.90
Ken Owen Landscaping Lodi $ 7,743.67
Pietro Talini's Nursery Sacramento S 7,800.63
B & V Landscaping Inc. Elk Grove $ 8,219.3
Albert Stein Landscape Co. Stockton $ 9,508.05
Weigum's Lodi Nursery Lodi $14,238.19
' Engineer's Estimate $ 6,355.00
E A tabu}at o o7ﬁthe bids is attached.
¥?’ {vvbﬁkw/ ?
/JaCK\L Ronsko -
‘Publxb Works Director
Attachment
cc: Assistant Finance Director
Recreation & Parks Director
SLR/ML/eeh i
wNA,DRcv £D: Filg M

4 THOMAS A PtltRSON City Manager




’

ALAS PARK PLAYGROUND IMPROVEMENTS (Phase vi

.andscaping Materials

TEM
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OKI HURSERY

<N OWENR LAKDSCAPIKG

DESCRIPTION
Botanical Name Common Name
Alnus Rhumbifolia White Alder
Betula Pendula European White Birch
Cedrus Deodora Calif. Christmas Tree
Cinnamomum Camphora Camphor Tree
Fraxinus Uhdei Shamel Ash
Gleditsia Triacanthos Sunburst Locust
Liriodendron Tulipifera Tulip Tree -
HMaytenus Boaria Mayten Tree
Pistache Chinensis Chinese Pistache
Sequcia Sempervirens Coastal Redwood
Sophora Japonica Chinese Scholar Tree
Ulmus Paryfolic Chinese Elm
SHRUB LIST
Botanical Name Common Name

Escallonia Fradesi None
Hebe Desilor Veronica
Raphiolepis Indica
Ballerina Hawthorne
Trachelospermum

Jasminoide Star Jasmine
Xylosma Congestum _ Shiny Xylosma

PLANT STAKES, TIES & FERTILIZER LIST

Lodge Pole Pine Tree Stake
Plant Fertilizer Tablets
Rubber Plant Ties
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Lbs.
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PIETRO TALINI'S

NURSERY & GIRDEN CENTER

ENG. ESTIMATE

Calif. Sales Tax

TOTAL BASE BID

EST UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
QY SIIE PRICE  PRICE PRICE  PRICE
16 15 Gal. $ 30 $ 480 $ 32.00 ¢ 512.00
14 15 Gal. $ 30 $ 420 $ 32.00 $ 448.00
12 15 Gal. $ 30 $ 360 $ 32.00 § 384.00
g 15 Gal $ 30 $ 270 $ 32.U0 § 288.U0
11 15 Gal. $ 30 $ 330 $ 22.00 % 352.00
20 15 Gal. $ 30 $ 600 $ 32.00 $ 640.00
19 1» Gal. $ 30 $ 570 NO BID WO Bl
3 1% Gal $ 30 $ 90 $ 36.00 % 108.00
4 15 Gal. $ 30 $ 120 $ 32.00 % 128.00
33 15 Gal. $ 30 $1170 $ 32.00 $1248.90
14 15 Gal. $ 30 t 420 N0 BID KO BID
6 15 Gal. $ 30 $ 180 KO BID MG 8lC
14 5 Gal. $ 15 $ 75 $ 7.75 $ 108.50
4 5 Gal. § i5 $ 60 $ 7.75 § 31.0G
38 5 Gal. $ 15 £ 75 $12.50 § 475.00
36 5 Gal. $ 15 $ 7% $ 7.75 % 275.00
3 5 Cat. $ 15 $ 75 $ 8.00 ¢ 24.00
285 10 feet % 2.00 $ 570 $ 2.75 % 108.5C
40 21 Cz. $ 2.00 $ 80 NO BID 1o 8iD
670 - $ 0.50 $ 335 NO 81D NO BID
BASE BID $6355 $5809.2%

B 8 V LANDSCAPING INC.

oo

Tabulation of bids received April 24, 1985

DELTA TREF FARMS INC.

348.56

$6,157.81

ALBERT F. STEIN
LANDSCAPE CG.

UNtT TOTAL UNIT
PRICE  PRICE PRICE

34.00 5 564.00 $ 32.50
32.00 § 448.20 $ 32.50
34.00 § 408.3C S 32.50
38.00 S 342.30 S 32.50
5i3  NO BID § 32.50
30-00  § 800-20 $ 32.50
34.00 5 546.20 $ 32.50
8i0  NO 313 € 32.50
38.00 5 152.2% $ 32.50
32.06 §1248.25 5 32.50
32.09 5 428.18 § 35.00
38.00 § 225.2C § 33.06
7.86 $ 10§.38 $6.50
810 N0 BIC s §.50
9.5 $ 361.2 5 8.5
7.20 ' 280.30 S 6.50
2ip NHO 8i3 $ 1.50
BI0 MO 812 $ 2.95
310 NG 3I0

510 0 BIZ s .30

TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE  PRICE
$ 520.00 $35.83 §$&73.28
S 455,00 $35.83 S 501.62
5 390.00 $ 37.50 § 4s0.00
S 292.50 $ 36.50 $ 328.30
$ 357.50 $35.83 § 394.13
$ 650.00 §£35.83 § 7i6.60
5 617.50 3 37.50 § 732.50
$ $33.00 $114.00
$ $39.00 S 158,00
s 35.83 S1397.37
RO 310 10 BID
S 36,50 S 21v.00
$ 792 51'0.88
5 10.50 S 42.00
$ 13.50 § 513.00
3 8.3C $ 291.63
3 7.85 § 23.85
S 3.50 § 997.50
§ 98.00
N .24 $160.80
S7300.63

UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE
5 35.00 S 560.00
$35.00 S 430.00
$35.00 5 420.00
$35.00 S 315.00
$35.00 S 385.00
$ 35.00 $ 700.00
S 35.00 S 665.00
S 36.00 S 108.00
S 37.00  $ 148.00
S 3550 $51365.00
$45.00 S 630.00
S 45.00 S 270.09
S 9.00 3 126.00
Siu.00 S 46.00
$10.06 $ 380.00
S 9.00  $ 324.00
S 9.00  $ 27.00
S 2.95 S 340.75
S 2.60 5 104.00
S g S 221.60
SR219 .25

8219

25

UNLT TOTAL s
PRICE  PRICE paice
S 12.00 s 8
$42.00 S §
$45.00 S 3
$az.00 S s
$42.00 S S

S 45.00 § 3

S 35.00 S S

S 45.00 3 $

S 45.00 § 5

S 4500 5
$42.00 55 5

$ 4500 S s

S 3.25 % 13

S 3.25 5 5

S 9.50 S $

S 825 § 3

s 9.10 s

S 325 % s

S 2.25 % 5

S 8¢ § s




