
RESOLUTION XO. 79 -8  

AWARD - ASPHALT MATERIAL FOR SECOND 
HALF O F  FISCAL YEAR 1978-79. 

WHEREAS, in a n s w e r  to notice duly published in a c c o r d a n c e  
with law and the o r d e r  of this City Council ,  s e a l e d  bids were re- 
ceived and publicly opened by the City C l e r k  of this C i t y  on T u e s d a y ,  
J anua ry  2 ,  1979 a t  11:OO a . m .  f o r  the c o n t r a c t  for  A s p h a l t  Material 
f o r  the Second Half of F i s c a l  Year 1978-79 a s  d e s c r i b e d  in the 
specifications the re fo r  approved by the C i t y  Council on W e d n e s d a y ,  
December  2 0 ,  1978; and 

WHEREAS, sa id  bids have been c o m p a r e d ,  c h e c k e d  and 
tabulated and a r epor t  thereof fi led with the C i t y  Manager as shown 
on tabulation m a r k e d  Exhibit “A“ a t t ached  he re to  and the r e b y  m a d e  
a p a r t  hereof;  

WHEREAS, the City Manager  r e c o m m e n d s  that  award be m a d e  
to the low bidder ,  Claude C. Wood CO. ,  I n c ;  

NOW, THEREFORE, B E  IT RESOLVED by the C i t y  Council of 
the City of Lodi that  award  of con t r ac t  f o r  A s p h a l t  Mater ia l  f o r  the 
Second Half of F i s c a l  Year 1978-79 be and the same is h e r e b y  m a d e  
to  Claude C.  Wood C o . ,  Inc . ,  the low b i d d e r  as s h o w n  on E x h i b i t  “A”  
at tached he reto.  

Dated: January 3 ,  1979 

I hereby cer t i fy  that Resolution No. 79-8 was passed and 
adopted by the Ci ty  Council of the C i ty  of Lodi in a regular meeting 
held the 3rd  day of J anua ry  2979 by the f o l l o w i n g  vote: 

Aye s : Councilmen - Hughes, K a t z a k i a n  a n d  M c C a r t y  

Noes : Councilmen - None 

Absent: Councilmen - Katnich and  P i n k e  r ton 

MES B. SCHROEDER 
EPUTY C I T Y  C L E R K  

79-8 



L I I  I WI L W U I  

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT BIDS FOR ASPHALT MATERIALS 

ITEM NO, 1 ITEM NO, 2 

Dense Grade Asphalt Concrete, Type 
3/8", Asphalt Binder shall be Viscos 

7 Grade AR-4000 Paving Asphalt, 

Dense Grade Asphalt Concrete, Type B, 
1/2". Asphalt Binder sholf be Viscosity 
Grade AR-4.000 Paving Asphalt. 

SiJPPLl ERS 
A 

F.O.B. Plan 
B 

Stockpile 
C i t y  L i m i t  
(100 Tons 

A 
F.O.B. Plant 

B 
Stockpile 
City Limi t s  

(100 Tons) 

C C 
Hopper of Paver Hopper of Pave 

1 (400 Tons) (400 Tons) ( 1800 Tons) (100 Tons) 

Claude C .  Wood Co. ,  Clernents 

$12.72 
1.72 

$14.787 Cost per ton including tax 
Plus  C i t y  cost. for mileage 

$16.006 ' $1 2.985 
1.72 

$1 5.052 $15.741 

$14.705 Total cost per ton $15.052 $16,006 $14.44 $14.787 $15.741 

No Bid 

Granite Construction Co., Stockton 

Cost per ton including tax 
P l u s  City cost for mileage 

$15.37 
2 3 2  

$18.55 No Bid $15.37 
2.52 

$18.55 

$18.55 $17.89 

~~ 

$18.55 
I 

No Bid Total cost per ton $17.89 No Bid 

Industrial Asphalt, Linden 

Cost per ton including tax 
Plus  City cost for mileage 

$14.31 
3.26 - 

$16.96 
-. 

$16.96 

$17.22 $13.25 
3.26 

$15.90 $16.16 
- 

* $16.16 

- .  

$16.51 $15.90 $17.22 Total cost per ton $17, !7 

L 


