

RESOLUTION NO. 4062

AWARD - CONTRACT FOR 60/ 12 KV HENNING SUBSTATION EQUIPMENT.

WHEREAS, in answer to notice duly published in accordance with law and the order of this City Council, sealed bids were received and publicly opened by the City Clerk of this City on April 29, 1975 at 11:00 a.m. for the contract for 60/ 12 KV Henning Substation Equipment as described in the specifications therefor approved by the City Council on March 5, 1975; and

WHEREAS, said bids have been compared, checked, and tabulated and a report thereof filed with the City Manager as per Exhibit "A" attached;

WHEREAS, the City Manager recommends that award be made as follows:

<u>Bidder</u>	<u>Material</u>	<u>Bid Price</u>	<u>Tax</u>	<u>Total Bid</u>
Westinghouse	Breakers (Items 1, 2, 3)	\$74,511.00	\$4,470.66	\$78,981.66*
Westinghouse	Switchboard (Item 4)	37,804.00	2,268.24	40,072.24
G. E. Supply Co.	Structure (Items 5- 11)	76,875.00	4,612.50	81,487.50
Graybar Electric	Console (Item 12)	7,027.00	421.62	7,448.62

*Estimated maximum escalation - \$5,655.92

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Lodi that award of contract for 60/ 12 KV Henning Substation Equipment be and the same is hereby made to Westinghouse Electric Supply, G. E. Supply Company, and Graybar Electric as recommended by the City Manager and for those amounts outlined above.

Dated: May 7, 1975

I hereby certify that Resolution No. 4062 was passed and adopted by the City Council of the City of Lodi in a regular meeting held May 7, 1975 by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen - Ehrhardt, Hughes, Katnich,
Pinkerton and Schaffer

Noes: Councilmen - None

Absent: Councilmen - None


ALICE M. REIMCHE
City Clerk

60/112-KV SUBSTATION EQUIPMENT - UD-E75-1

<u>Supplier</u>	<u>Breakers (Items 1,2,3)</u>		<u>Switchboard (Item 4)</u>		<u>Structure (Items 5-11)</u>		<u>Console (Item 12)</u>		<u>Total Including Tax</u>	
	<u>Basic Bid</u>	<u>Escalation</u>	<u>Basic Bid</u>	<u>Escalation</u>	<u>Basic Bid</u>	<u>Escalation</u>	<u>Basic Bid</u>	<u>Escalation</u>	<u>Basic Bid</u>	<u>Escalation</u>
Westinghouse	\$74,511.00	\$79,846.77	\$58,503.00	\$62,598.21	\$84,676.00	Firm	\$ 8,555.00	\$9,153.85	\$239,820.00	\$250,451.32 *
W st Alt. Bid	74 511 00	79 846 77	57 804 00	Firm	95 958 00	Firm	8,626.00	Firm	229,912.94	235,568.86
Graybar Elec.	85,174.00	86,874.00	48,172.00	Firm	82 592 00	Firm	7 027,00	Firm	235,557.44	237,359.44
C-E Supply	87,626.00	Firm	51,000.00	Firm	76,875.00	Firm	20 300 00	Firm	246,980.00	Firm
Valley Elec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	88,932.48	Firm	No Bid	N.A.	N.A.	N.A.
McGraw-Edison	23,409.00*	24,673.09*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N.A.	N.A.	N.D.

* Item 1 only - High Bid.

** Comments: Structure does not meet specifications